
Owmby by Spital Parish Council <owmbybyspitalparishcouncil@gmail.com>

Fwd: Cemetery gates quote
Julie Haycraft <owmbybyspitalparishcouncil@gmail.com> Thu, Sep 14, 2023 at 3:29 PM
Draft

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: gavin widdison <gavinwiddison@hotmail.co.uk>
Date: Fri, 11 Nov 2022, 19:11
Subject: Cemetery gates quote
To: OPC Clerk <owmbybyspitalparishcouncil@gmail.com>

Hi Julie 

Please find a�ached quote for materials form Listers �mber. (Please note this listers quote is only valid
for 30 days)
As discussed, it would be more financially viable for me to have the invoice made out to OPC so the vat
can be reclaimed.
the figure for materials includes my trade discount which I am more than happy to allocate to the
councils.
My labour charge to install the gates will be £1200.00.
Please be aware i am NOT vat registered.

Regards 

Gavin Widdison

RGW Services Property Maintenance

--
Julie Haycraft
Clerk to Owmby by Spital Parish Council
Tel 07766 396061

OWMBY BY SPITAL PARISH COUNCIL DISCLAIMER

The information contained in this e-mail along with any attachments may be confidential, legally privileged or otherwise protected from
disclosure.  It is intended for the named individual(s) or entity who is/are the only authorised recipient(s).  This e-mail should not be reproduced,
disseminated, disclosed, modified or distributed unless expressly authorised by the sender.

If this message has reached you in error please notify the sender immediately and delete it without review.

LISTERS TIMBER & BUILDERS MERCHANTS LTD - Quotation No. 422768.pdf
465K

mailto:gavinwiddison@hotmail.co.uk
mailto:owmbybyspitalparishcouncil@gmail.com
mailto:owmbybyspitalparishcouncil@gmail.com
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ui=2&ik=94d36672e0&view=att&th=18a94191a70946bf&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=184681e166354cd62391&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ui=2&ik=94d36672e0&view=att&th=18a94191a70946bf&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=184681e166354cd62391&safe=1&zw

